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Much has been written about the world’s first democracy, but no book so far has been dedicated solely to the
study of enmity in ancient Athens. Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens is a long-overdue analysis of the
competitive power dynamics of Athenian honor and the potential problems these feuds created for
democracies.

The citizens of Athens believed that harming one’s enemy was an acceptable practice and even the duty of
every honorable citizen. They sought public wins over their rivals, making enmity a critical element in
struggles for honor and standing, while simultaneously recognizing the threat that personal enmity posed to
the community. Andrew Alwine works to understand how Athenians addressed this threat by looking at the
extant work of Attic orators. Their speeches served as the intersection between private vengeance and public
sanction of illegal behavior, allowing citizens to engage in feuds within established parameters. This
mediation helped support Athenian democracy and provided the social underpinning to allow it to function in
conjunction with Greek notions of personal honor.

Alwine provides a framework for understanding key issues in the history of democracy, such as the
relationship between private and public realms, the development of equality and the rule of law, and the
establishment of individual political rights. Serving also as a nuanced introduction to the works of the Attic
orators, Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens is an indispensable addition to scholarship on Athens.
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From reader reviews:

Orlando Hernandez:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens (Ashley and Peter Larkin
Series in Greek and Roman Culture). Try to make book Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens (Ashley and
Peter Larkin Series in Greek and Roman Culture) as your friend. It means that it can to get your friend when
you truly feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned
for you. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let
me make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Barbara Duty:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important for all of us. The book Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens (Ashley and Peter
Larkin Series in Greek and Roman Culture) had been making you to know about other information and of
course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The publication Enmity and Feuding in
Classical Athens (Ashley and Peter Larkin Series in Greek and Roman Culture) is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your
own spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with all the book Enmity and Feuding in
Classical Athens (Ashley and Peter Larkin Series in Greek and Roman Culture). You never truly feel lose
out for everything in case you read some books.

Robert Harriman:

Often the book Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens (Ashley and Peter Larkin Series in Greek and
Roman Culture) will bring one to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to describe the idea
is very unique. If you try to find new book to see, this book very ideal to you. The book Enmity and Feuding
in Classical Athens (Ashley and Peter Larkin Series in Greek and Roman Culture) is much recommended to
you to study. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Minnie Rivera:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens
(Ashley and Peter Larkin Series in Greek and Roman Culture) e-book written by well-known writer whose to
say well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written throughout
good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal
hunger then you still doubt Enmity and Feuding in Classical Athens (Ashley and Peter Larkin Series in
Greek and Roman Culture) as good book but not only by the cover but also by the content. This is one
reserve that can break don't judge book by its protect, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick



that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth
sense.
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