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Indisputably, this is a modern classic of science. Based on a course of lectures delivered by the author at
Columbia University, the text is elementary in treatment and remarkable for its clarity and organization.
Although it is assumed that the reader is familiar with the fundamental facts of thermometry and calorimetry,
no advanced mathematics beyond calculus is assumed.
Partial contents: thermodynamic systems, the first law of thermodynamics (application, adiabatic
transformations), the second law of thermodynamics (Carnot cycle, absolute thermodynamic temperature,
thermal engines), the entropy (properties of cycles, entropy of a system whose states can be represented on a
(V, p) diagram, Clapeyron and Van der Waals equations), thermodynamic potentials (free energy,
thermodynamic potential at constant pressure, the phase rule, thermodynamics of the reversible electric cell),
gaseous reactions (chemical equilibria in gases, Van't Hoff reaction box, another proof of the equation of
gaseous equilibria, principle of Le Chatelier), the thermodynamics of dilute solutions (osmotic pressure,
chemical equilibria in solutions, the distribution of a solute between 2 phases vapor pressure, boiling and
freezing points), the entropy constant (Nernst's theorem, thermal ionization of a gas, thermionic effect, etc.).
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From reader reviews:

Mary Williams:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed
Thermodynamics (Dover Books on Physics)? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You recognize
beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with its opinion or you have some other opinion?

Christopher Henricks:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important usually. The book Thermodynamics (Dover Books on Physics) seemed
to be making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The publication Thermodynamics (Dover Books on Physics) is not only giving you more
new information but also for being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own spend
time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship together with the book Thermodynamics (Dover Books
on Physics). You never feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Christina Lazarus:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specially book entitled
Thermodynamics (Dover Books on Physics) the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every single aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each and
every word written in a e-book then become one application form conclusion and explanation in which
maybe you never get just before. The Thermodynamics (Dover Books on Physics) giving you one more
experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful details for your better life in this
particular era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will probably
be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting
spare time activity?

Martha Royal:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Thermodynamics (Dover Books on
Physics) publication written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which can be
understand by anyone who else read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every
ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still uncertainty Thermodynamics
(Dover Books on Physics) as good book not simply by the cover but also through the content. This is one
reserve that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to
pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to an
additional sixth sense.
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